
MINOR ATHLETE ABUSE PREVENTION PROGRAM (MAAPP)
As a condition of membership on Delta Aquatics, all athletes and parents must review the Minor
Athlete Abuse Prevention Policy (MAAPP).

Additional information can be found on the USA Swimming website, including webinars and slides.

I acknowledge that I have received, read and understood the Minor Athlete Abuse Prevention Policy
and/or that the Policy has been explained to me or my family. I further acknowledge and
understand that agreeing to comply with the contents of this Policy is a condition of my membership
with Delta Aquatics.

MEDIA POLICY & RELEASE

Delta Aquatics keeps a library of photographs, slides, and videos to use for current and future
promotional pieces. These promotional pieces may include brochures, videos, social media, web
sites, slide shows and similar items. At swim meets, at practice and any team activity or function,
photographs and video may be taken of your child.

All Delta participants agree to be filmed and photographed by the club-approved photographer(s)
and videographers, and to allow the right to use names and pictures before, during, or after
practices or meets such as in public psych sheets, heat sheets, and results or featured on the host
club or Delta website or social media or in a public broadcast of the event via television or webcast.

I hereby authorize Delta Aquatics to use photographs and/or video of me, my child(ren), and/or my
property and authorize the club and its assignees, licensees, legal representatives and transferees to
use and to publish (with or without my name, child/children name(s), company name, or with a
fictitious name) photographs, pictures, portraits or images herein described in any and all forms of
media and in all manners including composite images or distorted representations and for the
purposes of publicity, illustration, commercial art, advertising, publishing (including publishing in
electronic form or internet websites), for any product or services, or other lawful uses as may be
determined by Delta Aquatics for as long a time period as Delta determines the usage thereof is
necessary. I further waive any and all rights to review or approve any uses of the images, any written
copy or finished product. Furthermore, I hereby consent that such photographs, films and electronic
images shall be the sole property of Delta Aquatics and that Delta has the right to duplicate and
reproduce the images free and clear of any claim on my part.

Parents/guardians of minor swimmers who do not wish their swimmers to participate in interviews or
have individual pictures featured on any media should inform Jessica Bogie via email at
coachjessica@comcast.net.

https://www.teamunify.com/ildea/UserFiles/Image/QuickUpload/2021-maapp-2-0-delta_092631.pdf
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